
Mt. Diablo Unified School District 
2326 Bisso Lane 

Concord, CA 94520 
Phone: (925) 825-7440    Fax: (925) 687-5044 

 

RFP Results 
 

RFP #1787:  Charter Bus Services 
RFP Opening Date & Time:  October 3, 2017, at 11:00 a.m. 
 
Company City Phone Minimum of 4 Hours Excess Hourly 

Rate after 

Minimum 

Excess 

Mileage Fee 

% or Dollar Amount 

Discount Offered for 

Early Payment 

Whitecastle 
Tours, Inc. 

Livermore, 
CA 

(925) 743-1963 47 Passenger 
Coach-        
No Bid 
 

56 Passenger 
Coach-
$560.00 
 
 

School Bus-
No Bid 

$115.00 
 
 
 

$3.50 2% Net 10 

Sierra Pacific 
Tours 

Concord, 
CA 

(925) 825-8500 47 Passenger 
Coach- 
$710.00 

 

55 Passenger 
Coach-
$820.00 

 

School Bus-
No Bid 

$105.00 (47) 
$110.00 (55) 

$5.70 
$6.50 

_ 

American Stage 
Tours 

Concord, 
CA 

(925) 687-7705 47 Passenger 
Coach- 
$740.00 

 

56 Passenger 
Coach-
$855.00 

 

School Bus-
No Bid 

$90.00 $5.50 _ 

Vol-Ten Corp. 
d.b.a. Delta 
Charter Service 

Stockton, 
CA 

(209) 465-1053 47 Passenger 
Coach- 
$1,050.00 

 

56 Passenger 
Coach-
$1,123.00 

 

School Bus-
$929.00 

$75.00 2.00 0% 

 

 


