

Mt. Diablo Unified School District

2326 Bisso Lane
 Concord, CA 94520
 Phone: (925) 825-7440 Fax: (925) 687-5044

Bid Results

All bid amounts are Base Bid

RFP # 1683: Supplemental Student Transportation Services

Bid Opening Date & Time: June 6, 2014, at 10:00 a.m.

Company	City	Phone	To/From	Field /Special Trips	Mileage Rates Hourly & Excessive Miles
ALC	Santa Ana, CA	(949) 212-9955 (714) 782-6067 fax	No bid	Daily-78 Passenger Ambulatory 1-3 \$365.00 4-6 No Bid	Mileage Rates per mile Type A No Bid Type C No Bid Type C Lift No Bid Type D \$2.95 Hourly Rates - per Hour Type C No Bid Type D \$75.00 Lay-Over \$140.00 Excessive Miles Type C No Bid Type D \$75.00
First Student	City of Industry, CA	(562) 271-4674 (562) 463-0580 fax	No bid	Daily - 78 Passenger Ambulatory 1-3 \$55.00 4-6 No Bid	Hourly Rates - Per Mile Type C No Bid Type D \$2.95 Excessive Miles Type C No Bid Type D \$2.95
Michael's Transportation Service, Inc.	Vallejo, CA	(707) 674-6013 (707) 643-1906	Excess - Ambulatory 1-5 \$65.00 6-10 No bid 11+ No bid Daily - Non Ambulatory 1-5 \$65.00 6-10 No Bid 11+ No Bid	Daily-78 Passenger Ambulatory 1-3 \$600.00 4-6 No Bid	Mileage Rates per mile Type A \$2.99 Type C \$2.99 Type C Lift \$2.99 Type D No Bid Hourly Rates - per Hour Type C \$65.00 Type D No Bid Lay-Over \$25.00 Excessive Miles

Unresponsive Bid

Pawar Transportation LLC			Daily- Ambulatory 1-5 \$180.00 6-10 \$225.00 11+ \$ N/A Daily -Non Ambulatory 1-5 \$200.00 6-10 No Bid 11+ No Bid	Excess - Ambulatory 1-5 \$20.00 6-10 \$25.00 11+ \$ N/A Daily -Non Ambulatory 1-5 \$25.00 6-10 No Bid 11+ No Bid	Daily-78 Passenger Ambulatory 1-3 \$180.00 4-6 \$225.00	Daily - 78 Passenger Ambulatory 1-3 \$20.00 4-6 \$25.00	Mileage Rates per mile Type A \$1.50 Type C No Bid Type C Lift No Bid Type D No Bid Hourly Rates - per Hours Type C No Bid Type D No Bid Lay-Over No Bid Excessive Miles Type C No Bid Type D No Bid	Type C No Bid Type D No Bid Hourly Rates - Per Mile Type C No Bid Type D No Bid Excessive Miles Type C No Bid Type D No Bid
--------------------------------	--	--	--	---	--	--	--	--