

October 24, 2013

Mr. John Willford Mt. Diablo Unified School District 2010 Measure C 3333 Roland Way Concord CA 94519

Re: MDUSD RFQ 1627 District wide Security System Upgrades Subject: Pre-Construction Service Summary – Best and Final Offer

Dear Mr. Wilford,

Previously Mt. Diablo Unified School District (district) and Taber Construction Inc. (Taber) entered into a Pre-Construction Services Agreement (PSA) for the District Security System replacement project. During the PSA Taber conducted extensive on site research to document existing condition, evaluated various value engineering options related to equipment, and developed a prequalification criteria for electrical/low voltage subcontractors.

The on-site investigation scope included inspection of each facility, wherein our team evaluated existing exterior raceways (both above ground and underground) for the potential re-use with the new security system. Our team also evaluated alternate backbone routings, and conformed the drawings to reflect the current building configurations. Prior to the initial RFQ our team investigated building interior ceiling types to develop a matrix of hard lid ceilings vs. suspended ceilings. During the on-site investigation our team expended approximately 1,460 hours. Our investigation effort included a major support effort from Del Monte Electric; which contributed more than 1,200 man hours.

The field investigation effort resulted in a reduction in scope and cost of approximately 5,000 of underground conduit raceway as well as the identification of several above ground mounted conduits available for re-use.

Through group meetings we were able to identify several value engineering alternatives, including:

- Re-use of overhead conduits, subsequent to repair and upgrade to a first class condition.
- Reduce backbone security conduit from 2" to 1" GRC where cable fill does not exceed requirements.
- Change system to a fully addressable Bosch system.
- Correct siren, master panel, and administration door contact quantities to reflected basis of design.
- Re-use of interior conduit and wiremold security raceways.
- Perform overhead canopy work during normal working hours.

We have also developed an updated construction schedule based on updated District requirements and expectations that a major underground raceway effort can be accomplished during the winter recess.



The project will require that subcontractors work at least six sites concurrently to complete the project before the end of 2014; as such the electrical/low voltage scope of work is critical to the project's success. The electrical/low voltage subcontractor must have access to a large, qualified labor pool and be able to provide at least six full time foremen to lead the work crews.

The average duration is thirty calendar days per site, to accomplish the electrical/low voltage work within this timeframe each site will require approximately 5-7 workers per site, or an average of thirty-six person crew, plus supervision and support staff.

Given the significant staffing and supervisor requirements, coupled with the challenges associated with working swing-shift, working on congested roofs, and within working campuses it is essential to obtain a subcontractor that has proven experience delivering a project of this magnitude. We have developed reasonable pass/fail criteria to ensure that the best value is obtained and that the project will be delivered on time, safely, with the highest levels of quality.

The two remaining subcontract scope of work items include painting (minor painting of exterior conduits and general touch up) and asphalt trench patching. The projected proposal range for each of the bid packages is identified below:

Bid Package	Scope	Estimate	Firm's Invited
1	Painting	\$166,000	6
2	Asphalt Patching	\$189,000	8
3	Electrical/Low Voltage	\$8,000,000	9

The plans, specifications, and field investigation drawings were posted on Taber's FTP site for subcontractors to access.

We believe that our pre-construction efforts have resulted in significant cost saving solutions for the project and expect to deliver a system that provides the District with years of trouble-free operation.

By separate cover we have provided the District with the following:

- Marked up field investigation drawings (343 pages)
- Meeting minutes
- Subcontractor invitation log, by bid package
- Subcontractor cost estimates
- Estimates for self-performed work

The attached pricing schedule reflects our value engineering efforts and subsequent discussions with the District's project team. Key discussion elements include:

• Underground conduit cover is reduced to 18" minimum.



- Existing raceways may be re-used, existing raceways containing low voltage systems (except public address and phone) may be used to share the new security cabling; the contractor shall be responsible for ensuring that existing cables are not damaged; any damage shall be repaired by the contract at no cost to the District.
- In cases where planned new overhead conduit can be further reduced in quantity, the District will be credited unused footage at the established unit price. Quantities will be verified by field measuring after installation.
- Contractor may relocate motion detectors to provide reduced routing, however contractor shall maintain system coverage and ensure that no obstructions are present that would decrease system coverage.
- The contractor may utilize existing interior wire ways, these will be secured equal to or better than their present condition. Existing wire ways not altered shall remain as installed.
- Exterior conduits that are re-used shall be repaired to provide adequate supports, fittings and connections at no additional cost to the District.
- The security system will be a Bosch addressable system as described in earlier discussions.

Should you have additional questions please feel free to contact the undersigned.

Sincerely,

Oskar Nadjari Oskar Nadjari Taber Construction Inc.



MDUSD District Wide Security System GMP Summary of Design Modifications

Original Base Bid Proposal 9,138,187.38

	•	
EVE 1	Change to fully addressable system	(272,177.00)
EVE 2	Re-use existing site and canopy conduit	(294,678.00)
EVE 3	Change canopy conduit from 2" to 1"	(192,787.00)
EVE 4	Re-use conduit and wiremold at interior	(39,996.00)
EVE 5	Revise trench cover to 18"	(30,509.00)
ERFI 1	Add sirens (1@ES, 2@MS/HS)	16,534.00
ERFI 2	Add touchscreens	1,677.00
ERFI 3	Add security panel	2,767.00
ERFI 4	Add door contacts to Administration	7,108.00
ERFI 5	Integrate buildings not originally designated	4,155.00
SVE 1	Reduce trench sawcutting to align with EVE 2	(21,829.50)
SVE 2	Reduce trench patching to align with EVE 2	(83,612.28)
SVE 3	Reduce offhaul trench spoils to align with EVE 2	(10,880.00)
SVE 4	Reduce offhaul trench spoils to align with EVE 5	(7,760.00)
SVE 5	Reduce conduit painting to align with EVE 2	(79,100.00)
SVE 6	Reduction of overall construction schedule	(31,000.00)
SVE 7	Delete contruction trailers	(5,600.00)
UP 1	Add/Delete door contact	261.00
UP 3	Add/Delete 2" conduit underground, trenched	20.00
UP 3	Add 1" conduit overhead	17.42
UP 5	Add/Deduct patch paving	\$6.02
	Total Summary of above adds/deducts	(1,037,687.78)

Revised Base Proposal 8,100,499.60
Performance and Payment Bonds (0.006%) 48,603.00
General Liability Insurance (0.80%) 65,192.82
Contractor's Fee (5%) 410,714.77

Total Revised GMP 8,625,010.19 District Contingency (3%) 258,750.31

Total W/Contingency 8,883,760.49



MDUSD District Wide Security System GMP Detail of Design Modifications

		Unit of	Original	Revised			Price
Item	Description	Measure	Quantity	Quantity	Delta	Unit Price	Adjustment
SVE 1	Sawcutting	LF	31,040.0	21,590.0	(9,450.0)	\$ 2.31	\$ (21,829.50)
SVE 2	Aggregate base and paving	SF	23,017.0	15,895.0	(7,122.0)	\$ 11.74	\$ (83,612.28)
SVE 3	Dispose of excess material	CY	1,722.0	1,178.0	(544.0)	\$ 20.00	\$ (10,880.00)
SVE 4	Dispose of excess material (reduce depth 6")	CY	194.0	-	388.0	\$ (20.00)	\$ (7,760.00)



Mt. Diablo Unified School District District Wide Security Improvements

Site	General Conditions	Underground Raceway	Asphalt Patch and Sawing	Interior/Exterior Raceway	Low Voltage Cabling/Install	Security Equipment	Roof Support Pads & Jacks	Painting & Pre- Finishing	Custodial OT	Sub Total	Contractor's Fee (5%)	Performance & Payment Bonds	Sub Total	3% District Contingency	Grand Total	Alternate 1	Alternate 2
Ayers Elementary School	9,905.00	10,949.00	6,490.19	31,009.00	22,742.00	15,088.00	600.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	104,483.19	5,224.16	658.24	110,365.59	3,310.97	113,676.56	15,382.50	24,706.50
Bancroft Elementary School	9,905.00	-	-	47,388.00	23,324.00	16,265.00	394.84	5,900.00	1,800.00	104,976.84	5,248.84	661.35	110,887.04	3,326.61	114,213.65	37,012.50	29,373.75
Bel Air Elementary School	9,905.00	9,765.00	5,088.00	70,628.00	25,713.00	17,332.00	545.93	5,900.00	1,800.00	146,676.93	7,333.85	924.06	154,934.84	4,648.05	159,582.89	21,816.90	38,217.90
Cambridge Elementary School	9,905.00	12,962.00	7,780.00	59,350.00	24,054.00	16,996.00	1,216.52	5,900.00	1,800.00	139,963.52	6.998.18	881.77	147,843.47	4,435.30	152,278,77	27,448.05	35,378.70
Clayton Valley High School	9,905.00	9,509.00	-	174,880.00	48,569.00	37,545.00	1,853.95	17,700.00	3,000.00	302,961.95	15,148.10	1,908.66	320,018.71	9,600.56	329,619.27	42,240.45	83,263.95
College Park High School	9,905.00	14,868.00	11.000.00	183.829.00	44.417.00	33,837.00	1,667.30	17,700.00	3,000.00	320,223,30	16.011.17	2,017.41	338,251,87	10,147.56	348,399,43	36.461.25	72,799.65
Concord High School	9,905.00	26,469.00	25,850.00	149,952.00	50,958.00	31,890.00	1,697.59	17,700.00	3,000.00	317,421.59	15,871.08	1,999.76	335,292.43	10,058.77	345,351.20	35,983.50	80,875.20
Delta View Elementary School	9,905.00	-	6,740.00	25,357.00	32,884.00	17,218.00	1,039.54	5,900.00	1,800.00	100,843.54	5,042.18	635.31	106,521.03	3,195.63	109,716.66	6,105.75	20,959.05
James Dent Administration Center	9,905.00	9,650.00	2,775.03	43,171.00	51,553.00	29,440.00	-	5,900.00	100.00	152,494.03	7,624.70	960.71	161,079.44	4,832.38	165,911.83	23,989.35	6,300.00
Diablo View Middle School	9,905.00	28,837.00	13,548.62	86,292.00	30,192.00	21,204.00	-	11,800.00	1,800.00	203,578.62	10,178.93	1,282.55	215,040.10	6,451.20	221,491.30	46,508.70	54,134.85
Eagle Peak Mintessori School	9,905.00	11,295.00	4,058.48	33,844.00	13,511.00	9,963.00	400.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	90,676.48	4,533.82	571.26	95,781.57	2,873.45	98,655.01	19,060.65	15,456.00
El Dorado Middle School	9,905.00	23,358.00	12,767.71	98,996.00	34,808.00	25,865.00	1,000.10	11,800.00	1,800.00	220,299.81	11,014.99	1,387.89	232,702.69	6,981.08	239,683.77	51,830.10	51,502.50
El Monte Elementary School	9,905.00	9,998.00	2,874.57	74,206.00	22,953.00	14,050.00	1,600.01	5,900.00	1,800.00	143,286.58	7,164.33		151,353.62	4,540.61	155,894.22	47,696.25	33,054.00
Fair Oaks Elementary School	9,905.00	10,603.00	6,440.00	61,717.00	20,753.00	12,456.00	424.28	5,900.00	1,800.00	129,998.28	6,499.91	818.99	137,317.18	4,119.52	141,436.70	25,456.20	40,653.90
Foothill Middle School	9,905.00	9,254.00	2,587.06	102,360.00	18,672.00	22,822.00	930.12	11,800.00	1,800.00	180,130.18	9,006.51	1,134.82	190,271.51	5,708.15	195,979.65	8,064.00	49,077.00
Glenbrook Middle School	9,905.00	5,131.00	2,534.66	90,450.00	22,719.00	25,405.00	687.40	11,800.00	1,800.00	170,432.06	8,521.60	1,073.72	180,027.38	5,400.82	185,428.21	38,627.40	51,088.80
Gregory Gardens Elementary School	9,905.00	4,530.00	1,345.35	61,951.00	26,545.00	21,883.00	930.12	5,900.00	1,800.00	134,789.47	6,739.47	849.17	142,378.12	4,271.34	146,649.46	18,045.30	45,738.00
Hidden Valley Elementary School	9,905.00	34,463.00	5,654.54	70,091.00	41,781.00	16,982.00	774.56	5,900.00	1,800.00	187,351.10	9,367.56	1,180.31	197,898.97	5,936.97	203,835.94	19,386.15	43,235.85
Highlands Elementary School	9,905.00	6,294.00	2,929.87	80,669.00	24,526.00	14,757.00	774.56	5,900.00	1,800.00	147,555.43	7,377.77	929.60	155,862.80	4,675.88	160,538.68	33,458.25	32,587.80
Holbrook Elementary School	9,905.00	1,232.00	-	53,963.00	19,000.00	14,361.00	773.68	5,900.00	1,800.00	106,934.68	5,346.73	673.69	112,955.10	3,388.65	116,343.76	9,742.95	41,534.85
Loma Vista Adult Center	9,905.00	13,472.00	3,374.06	125,826.00	37,862.00	24,531.00	1,600.24	17,700.00	3,000.00	237,270.30	11,863.52	1,494.80	250,628.62	7,518.86	258,147.48	41,935.95	83,257.65
Maintenance and Operations	9,905.00	9,378.00	6,358.54	51,010.00	19,732.00	233,580.00	930.12	5,900.00	1,800.00	338,593.66	16,929.68	2,133.14	357,656.48	10,729.69	368,386.18	-	7,699.65
Meadow Homes Elementary School	9,905.00	18,471.00	10,421.41	82,723.00	36,471.00	17,875.00	1,062.13	5,900.00	1,800.00	184,628.54	9,231.43	1,163.16	195,023.13	5,850.69	200,873.82	27,526.80	50,905.05
Monte Gardens Elementary School	9,905.00	12,328.00	8,474.44	61,265.00	23,930.00	14,432.00	774.56	5,900.00	1,800.00	138,809.00	6,940.45	874.50	146,623.95	4,398.72	151,022.67	21,917.70	45,465.00
Mountain View Elementary School	9,905.00	8,949.00	6,069.51	51,320.00	29,783.00	14,847.00	930.12	5,900.00	1,800.00	129,503.63	6,475.18	815.87	136,794.68	4,103.84	140,898.52		33,513.90
Mt Diablo Elementary School	9,905.00	7,933.00	2,919.68	76,663.00	28,650.00	17,890.00	930.30	5,900.00	1,800.00	152,590.98	7,629.55	961.32	161,181.85	4,835.46	166,017.31	20,934.90	56,670.60
Mt Diablo High School	9,905.00	68,516.00	33,380.28	176,918.00	87,576.00	42,989.00	1,664.00	17,700.00	3,000.00	441,648.28	22,082.41	2,782.38	466,513.08	13,995.39	480,508.47	52,027.50	124,398.75
Northgate High School	9,905.00	16,250.00	6,719.50	99,300.00	52,758.00	20,411.00	-	11,800.00	3,000.00	220,143.50	11,007.18	1,386.90	232,537.58	6,976.13	239,513.71	2,306.85	87,848.25
Oak Grove Middle School	9,905.00	8,982.00	3,687.70	119,182.00	32,071.00	20,782.00	990.14	11,800.00	1,800.00	209,199.84	10,459.99	1,317.96	220,977.79	6,629.33	227,607.12	36,882.30	59,439.45
Olympic High School	9,905.00	24,222.00	9,103.47	50,227.00	33,073.00	28,342.00	990.27	17,700.00	1,800.00	175,362.74	8,768.14	1,104.79	185,235.66	5,557.07	190,792.73	10,863.30	44,940.00
Pine Hollow Middle School	9,905.00	16,005.00	4,071.46	85,617.00	34,241.00	20,456.00	1,004.15	11,800.00	1,800.00	184,899.61	9,244.98	1,164.87	195,309.46	5,859.28	201,168.74	42,462.00	45,439.80
Pleasant Hill Elementary School	9,905.00	12,397.00	6,616.41	65,453.00	14,900.00	15,341.00	990.14	5,900.00	1,800.00	133,302.55	6,665.13	839.81	140,807.48	4,224.22	145,031.71	23,933.70	38,298.75
Pleasant Hill Middle School	9,905.00	2,641.00	1,014.16	132,276.00	43,707.00	35,485.00	2,684.43	11,800.00	1,800.00	241,312.59	12,065.63	1,520.27	254,898.49	7,646.95	262,545.44	39,596.55	87,606.75
Rio Vista Elementary School	9,905.00	4,717.00	1,154.14	66,872.00	17,080.00	14,791.00	200.10	5,900.00	1,800.00	122,419.24	6,120.96	771.24	129,311.44	3,879.34	133,190.79	14,139.30	32,568.90
Riverview Middle School	9,905.00	26,559.00	7,071.87	137,083.00	62,523.00	26,602.00	1,201.23	11,800.00	1,800.00	284,545.10	14,227.26	1,792.63	300,564.99	9,016.95	309,581.94	56,723.10	
Sequoia Elementary School	9,905.00	8,174.00	2,080.77	59,104.00	20,480.00	14,903.00	932.17	5,900.00	1,800.00	123,278.94	6,163.95	776.66	130,219.54	3,906.59	134,126.13	18,574.50	31,984.05
Sequoia Middle School	9,905.00	13,142.00	9,310.38	63,426.00	23,534.00	22,345.00	990.00	11,800.00	1,800.00	156,252.38	7,812.62	984.39	165,049.39	4,951.48	170,000.87	21,537.60	44,038.05
Shadelands Center	9,905.00	13,671.78	6,740.00	25,866.00	12,618.00	11,374.00	-	5,900.00	1,800.00	87,874.78	4,393.74	553.61	92,822.13	2,784.66	95,606.79	2,136.75	16,545.90
Shore Acres Elementary School	9,905.00	8,518.05	2,438.00	58,764.00	15,604.00	13,695.00	990.14	5,900.00	1,800.00	117,614.19	5,880.71	740.97	124,235.87	3,727.08	127,962.94	23,064.30	39,514.65
Silverwood Elementary School	9,905.00	14,463.00	14,257.37	48,520.00	27,567.00	14,923.00	700.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	138,035.37	6,901.77	869.62	145,806.76	4,374.20	150,180.96	16,557.45	40,749.45
Strandwood Elementary School	9,905.00	2,968.00	1,353.79	67,380.00	22,114.00	13,721.00	1,188.15	5,900.00	1,800.00	126,329.94	6,316.50		133,442.32	4,003.27	137,445.59	20,763.75	33,324.90
Sun Terrace Elementary School	9,905.00	9,073.00	3,040.51	56,395.00	32,349.00	15,690.00	800.19	5,900.00	1,800.00	134,952.70	6,747.64	850.20	142,550.54	4,276.52	146,827.05	,	31,806.60
Sunrise School	9,905.00	-	-	32,949.00	13,758.00	11,216.00	705.66	5,900.00	1,800.00	76,233.66	3,811.68	480.27	80,525.61	2,415.77	82,941.38	13,147.05	14,284.20
Valhalla Elementary School	9,905.00	10,017.00	5,399.31	74,710.00	26,550.00	15,441.00	1,342.17	5,900.00	1,800.00	151,064.48	7,553.22	951.71	159,569.41	4,787.08	164,356.49	20,405.70	37,410.45
Valle Verde Elementary School	9,905.00	6,085.00	2,091.56	48,613.00	28,210.00	15,020.00	788.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	118,412.56	5,920.63	746.00	125,079.19	3,752.38	128,831.56	,	30,084.60
Valley View Middle School	9,905.00	5,241.00	1,622.67	76,686.00	30,942.00	20,744.00	1,554.00	11,800.00	1,800.00	160,294.67	8,014.73		169,319.26	5,079.58		19,897.50	
Walnut Acres Elementary School	9,905.00	12,949.00	3,519.76	58,434.00	18,868.00	13,031.00	1,386.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	125,792.76	6,289.64		132,874.89	3,986.25		27,272.70	
Westwood Elementary School	9,905.00	9,016.00	3,720.68	63,275.00	23,250.00	12,865.00	1,385.50	5,900.00	1,800.00	131,117.18	6,555.86		138,499.08	4,154.97		20,193.60	
Transportation and Purchasing*	9,905.00	-	-	26,717.00	24,159.00		-	5,900.00	100.00	66,781.00	3,338.92		70,540.64	2,116.22	72,656.86		6,300.00
Willow Creek Center	9,905.00	4,159.00	1,873.03	29,863.00	16,213.00	11,516.00	-	5,900.00	100.00	79,529.03	3,976.45		84,006.51	2,520.20	86,526.71		
Woodside Elementary School	9,905.00	27,043.00	10,676.77	51,268.00	24,715.00	16,556.00	400.00	5,900.00	1,800.00	148,263.77	7,413.19		156,611.02		161,309.35		
Wren Avenue Elementary School	9,905.00	13,184.00	5,960.94	65,116.00	15,961.00	15,558.00	788.19	5,900.00	1,800.00	134,173.13	6,708.66		141,727.08	4,251.81		38,475.15	
Ygnacio Valley Elementary School	9,905.00	7,036.00	3,532.30	87,626.00	21,976.00		1,815.10	5,900.00	1,800.00	156,528.40	7,826.42		165,340.95	4,960.23	170,301.18		
Ygnacio Valley High School	9,905.00	32,080.00	17,661.30	128,668.00	58,253.00	37,108.00	1,976.00	17,700.00	3,000.00	306,351.30	15,317.57		323,598.88	9,707.97	333,306.84	36,349.95	88,248.30
	534,870.00	686,806.83	326,179.85	4,105,218.00	1,611,152.00	1,256,357.00	51,003.70	466,100.00	100,500.00	9,138,187.38	456,909.24	57,570.58	9,652,667.20	289,580.02	9,942,247.21		

*Security Equipment included in M&O

Total Base Bid 9,652,667.09
Total Alternate 1 1,376,679.15
Total Alternate 2 2,356,788.00
Total Alternate 3 33,600.00
Total 3% District Contingency on Base Bid 289,580.01

Base Bid + Contingency 9,942,247.10

ID	Task Name	Duration	Start	Finish	Qtr 4	, 2013		Qtr 1, 2	2014		Qtr 2,	2014		Qtr 3,	2014		Qtr 4, 2	014	
1	NTD	1 day	Man 44/40/42	Man 44/49/49	Oct		Dec	Jan	Feb	Mar	Apr	May	Jun	Jul	Aug	Sep	Oct	Nov	Dec
1	NTP	1 day	Mon 11/18/13	Mon 11/18/13			****												
2	Shop Drawings	10 days	Mon 11/18/13	Tue 12/3/13		-	<u> </u>												
3	Submittal Review	10 days	Wed 12/4/13	Tue 12/17/13															
4	Group #1	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14															
5	Maintenance & Ops	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		→													
6	Pleasant Hill ES	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		→													
7	Meadow Homes ES	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		→		_											
8	Mt. Diablo HS	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		→		_											
9	Pine Hollow MS	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		→													
10	Valley View MS	40 days	Mon 11/18/13	Fri 1/17/14		4		_											
11	Group #2	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14															
12	Eagle Peak Montessori	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14					-	1									
13	Foothill MS	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14	1					-									
14	Northgate HS	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14						-									
15	Concord HS	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14						_									
16	Walnut Acres MS	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14															
17	Ygnacio Valley HS	33 days	Mon 1/13/14	Fri 2/28/14															
18	Group #3	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
19	Bancroft ES	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
20	Oak Grove MS	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
21	Valle Verde ES	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
22	Willow Creek Center	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
23	Woodside ES	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
24	Ygnacio Valley ES	35 days	Mon 2/24/14	Fri 4/11/14															
25	Group #4	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14															
26	Cambridge ES	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14															
27	Fair Oaks ES	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14							+								
28	Pleasant Hill Adult Center	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14							+								
29	Sequoia ES	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14							- *								
30	Sequoia MS	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14							-								
31	Strandwood ES	31 days	Fri 4/4/14	Fri 5/16/14															
32	Group #5	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14															
33	College Park HS	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14															
	- College Faire Fig.	0-t days	101011 0/ 12/ 14	1110/21/14															
		Task		M	leston	е	♦			Exte	rnal Ta	sks							
MDUSD Date: M	Security on 10/21/13	Split		Sı	ımmar	у				Exte	rnal Mi	estone	♦						
		Progress		Pi	oject S	Summary				Dead	dline		Ţ						
						Page	1												

ID	Task Name	Duration	Start	Finish	Qtr 4, 2013		Qtr 1, 2014		Qtr 2, 201		Qtr 3, 2014	Qtr 4, 2014	
34	El Monte ES	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14	Oct Nov	Dec	Jan Feb	Mar		1ay Jun	Jul Aug Sep	Oct Nov	Dec
		-								-			
35	Gregory Gardens ES	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14	-								
36	Hidden Valley ES	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14									
37	Loma Vista Adult Center	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14						<u> </u>			
38	Valhalla ES	34 days	Mon 5/12/14	Fri 6/27/14							H		
39	Group #6	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14									
40	Glenbrook MS	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14							↓		
41	Holbrook ES	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14									
42	Olympic HS	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14							<u> </u>		
43	Sun Terrace ES	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14							Ĺ		
44	Sunrise ES	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14							Ĺ		
45	Wren Avenue ES	34 days	Mon 6/23/14	Fri 8/8/14	1								
46	Group #7	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14	1								
47	James Dent Admin	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14	1						I I h		
48	El Dorado MS	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14									
49	Monte Gardens ES	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14									
50	Mountain View ES	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14									
51	Shadelands Special Ed	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14									
52	Westwood ES	35 days	Mon 8/4/14	Fri 9/19/14									
53	Group #8	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14	-								
54	Ayers ES	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14								i i	
55	Clayton Valley HS	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14									
56	Diablo View MS	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14	-							_	
57	Highlands ES	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14	1								
58	Mt. Dialo ES	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14	1								
59	Silverwood ES	29 days	Mon 9/15/14	Fri 10/24/14									
60	Group #9	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	-								
61	Bel Air ES	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	1								
62	Delta View ES	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	1								
63	Rio Vista ES	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	1								
64	Riverview MS	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	1								
65	Shore Acres ES	29 days	Mon 10/20/14	Fri 11/28/14	-								
		, ,			<u> </u>						<u> </u>		
	1		,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,							_		
		Task		M	ilestone	•		Exte	rnal Tasks				
	O Security Ion 10/21/13	Split		S	ummary			Exte	rnal Milesto	ne 🔷			
- a.o. IVI		Progress			roject Summary			Dead	dline	\Box			
		J				•							
					Page 2								



Request for Subcontractor Proposals

Project:

Mt Diablo Unified School District - District Wide Security System

Location:

Contra Costa County (various site)

Bid Date:

October 24, 2013 @ 3:00 PM via facsimile only

Taber Construction Inc. has entered into a Preliminary Services Agreement with Mt. Diablo Unified School District and is in the process of compiling Guaranteed Maximum Pricing for the District Wide Security System project. Construction is expected to start December, 2013 and be completed in late 2014. There are fifty-three facilities, which will be constructed in phases; each phase is expected to include six facilities, or sites.

Pricing must be submitted by site; however the work will be awarded as a single package per bid package.

The work will primarily occur during non-school hours, approximately 3:30 PM to 11:00 PM, and on weekends as required. All personnel will require badging and DOJ clearance.

In general the project includes construction of new security systems at each District facility. This work includes but is not limited to underground conduit distribution, asphalt patching, painting, security equipment, electrical and low voltage installation. The new system will utilize a combination of new and existing raceways located underground, on canopies, under canopies, exposed inside buildings and concealed in buildings. No hard lid ceilings or walls will be opened for this project.

Subcontractors will be responsible for daily clean up, temporary measures, moving of furniture, and other requirements typically encountered when working within an occupied facility. The sites will remain operational and at the end of each work shift the facility must be returned to its pre-construction state, including but not limited to final cleaning.

Taber Construction Inc. is requesting subcontractor proposals for the following divisions of work:

Asphalt Patching

Painting

Electrical (including low voltage)

The scope of work for the respective division of work is attached. The initial project drawings can be viewed on our website FTP at www.taberconstruction.com; click on FTP in the top right corner, enter "plans" for username and password; the file is "MDUSD Security".

All questions shall be submitted in writing, by fax or email. Hard copy sets of plans and specs can be viewed in our office during normal working hours. It is imperative that all prospective bidders carefully review and account for all safety, quality, and testing provisions; no additional compensation will be made for failure to include the aforementioned requirements in your proposal. All subcontractors will be required to execute a standard Taber Construction Inc subcontract agreement without modifications. A copy of the standard agreement will be furnished upon written request. Taber Construction Inc is-an equal-opportunity-employer. Taber-Gonstruction-Inc is-signatory-to the Carpenters and Laborer's Collective Bargaining Agreements.



Mt. Diablo Unified School District - District Wide Security Project

Subcontractor Scope of Work

Asphalt Patching and Aggregate Base

The scope of work shall include furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment to complete asphalt pavement patching and repair at new underground trench routes. Asphalt shall be commercial quality; hot mixed type conforming to Caltrans requirements. Compacted thickness of asphalt shall be 3". Include applying tack oil to existing asphalt edges. Include furnishing and installation of 6" of class II base rock, compacted to 95% at all trenches. The subgrade below the base rock section will be compacted by others.

The actual trench will be 12" wide, and the existing asphalt will be overcut and removed by others to provide an asphalt patch width of 18".

Following is a summary of trench footage per site; the work must occur during non-school hours (after 3:30 PM Monday thru Friday), weekends, or other weekdays when school is not in session; the subcontract will define whether the work is performed weekdays or weekends. This subcontractor will need to remove and stockpile temporary plywood covers placed over the trenches by others. Upon completion of each shift this contractor shall thoroughly clean the work area and traveled way of all debris, dirt, rocks, etc. All excess debris shall be removed from the site.

Pricing shall be submitted by site; however the work will be awarded as a single subcontract. Unit prices shall also be provided for added/deleted footage of asphalt as well as added/deleted aggregate base.

A tentative phasing schedule is also attached.

Site	LF of Trenching
Ayers Elementary School	165
Bel Air Elementary School	150
Cambridge Elementary School	160
College Park High School	235
Concord High School	760
James Dent Administration Center	50
Diablo View Middle School	265
Eagle_Peak_Mintessori_School	20
El Dorado Middle School	520
El Monte Elementary School	60



Fair Oaks Elementary School	30	1
Foothill Middle School	150	J. Sameral
Glenbrook Middle School	100	
Gregory Gardens Elementary School	15	
Hidden Valley Elementary School	290	
Highlands Elementary School	225	
Holbrook Elementary School	10	
Loma Vista Adult Center	185	
Maintenance and Operations	190	
Meadow Homes Elementary School	80	(a) (a) (b)
Monte Gardens Elementary School	100	
Mountain View Elementary School	70	
Mt Diablo Elementary School	150	
Mt Diablo High School	1,620	
Northgate High School	130	
Oak Grove Middle School	110	
Olympic High School	300	171
Pine Hollow Middle School	190	
Pleasant Hill Elementary School	260	
Pleasant Hill Middle School	20	
Rio Vista Elementary School	60	
Riverview Middle School	390	
Sequoia Elementary School	70	
Sequoia Middle School	290	
Shadelands Center	230	
Shore Acres Elementary School	70	7 (* e
Silverwood Elementary School	300	
Strandwood Elementary School	60	
Sun Terrace Elementary School	70	
Valhalla Elementary School	125	
Valle Verde Elementary School	80	
Valley View Middle School	330	
Walnut Acres Elementary School	120	
Westwood Elementary School	145	
Willow Creek Center	55	
Woodside Elementary School	150	
Wren Avenue Elementary School	200	
Ygnacio Valley Elementary School	310	
Ygnacio Valley High School	930	



5	0	(Sast rome	(buster)	Table 1	Fran	Preodostana	Sept. 10 Dect. 1) Maching Devil 12 Dect. 12 Dect. 12 Dect. 12 Dect. 13 Dect. 12 Dect. 13 Dect	ASSIGN DESIGN NO	31 51 4
-		ièwaid/NTP	leav	1\Ved9/11/13	:Wed 9/11/15		511117 WIT ** 1515 17 17 1W 15 1 1 15	1510111717	
2	-	Freedn	2 stay		Thu 9/12/13	ii .	1		- 4
	-	(Subminal)	115days	Mon 9/9/13		1			
4	-	Construction Duration	1305 days	1Man 9/30/13					
	1-	M&O/Central Services	(45 dry)	[Mon 9/30/13		13	1	19. 0	
6	-	Ho/breok.E3	50 days	1Mon 9/20/13		1535			
-	-	Clayton Valley RS	Hodays	IMon 9/30/13		555	- [
۵	100	ML Dibble ES	30 drys	124en 9/30/13		1555			
	1	Pieasant HallES	30 days	126on 10/7/13		1555+5 days	1		
10	1	CoBage Parkits	140 days	Man 10/7/12		1555+5 days			
11	1	Mr. Diable H5	. 140 cars	1Mon 11/11/13		16			
12		Concord H5	190 days	Ithon 11/11/13		15			
12		Oak Grave MS	125 days	(Mon 11/12/13		i9	· #E		
13.	1	Pine Hollow MG	AS days	Mon 12/2/13		15			
15	1	foethii MS	(35 days	Men 11/25/13		7			
15	-	Northeate HS	:40 days	13/on 12/2/13		110			
17	1	Ygnacio Valley HS	140 days		Fri 2/26/14	111			-
12	1	Ciayron Valley HS	(4D days		Fel 2/20/14	111	1111		
13	1	BelAirES	(30 days		1Frl 2/14/14	113			
:0	1	Cambridge EX	30 days		Tri 2/23/14	114	727		
21	1	Yenacio Valley ES	120 days	12/on 1/13/14		115	+11		
22		Fair Oaks ES	i30 days	If.lon 1/27/14		116			
-3-	-	Meadow Homes ES	(30 days	IfAcn 2/17/14		119			
24		Olympie HS	140 days		Fri 4/25/14	120			
15		El Monte ES	10 days	(Mon 2/24/14		121	4111		
26		Nio Vota ES	130 days		Eri 4/11/19	117		-	
-		Glenbrock MS	135 days		Fri 4/15/14	11E	4271		
15		Sun Terrace ES	130 days		Fri 4/12/14	122	TI		
7,	-	fiverview M5	135 days		Fri 5/16/14	21			
35 :	-	Shore Agres E5	130 Gays		Fri 5/16/14	125			
11		Segunia MS	a5 days	(41on 4/14/14		126	41		
12	-	Hidden Valley ES	i30 days	Mon 4/25/14		124	12.1		
ZZ		Valley View ILLS	135 days	Mon4/21/14		127	+11		
1	-	Highlands E5	130 days	Mon 4/21/14		125			
15		El Dorado MS	135 days	Man 5/19/14		129			
1	-	SVren Ave ES	130 cays	Mon 5/15/14		130	ETC		
7	-	Mountain View ES	130 days			131	<u> </u>		
5		Walnus Acres E5	idD days			132	FE 11		
5	***************************************	Pleasant Hill Ed Ctr	i30 days			134			
3	****	Gegusty ES	(30 days			133			
1	-	Woodside ES	130 8315	Mon 5/30/14		135	411		
=		Valle Verde ES	180 days			135			
-		Monte Gardens ES	130 days	1Mon 7/14/14		137			
-		Avera ES	130 €375			132			
5		Valnalia E3	30 days			133	- 1		
5	-	Bancroft ES	ind days	184on 7/21/14		140			
		Silverwood ES	130 days	Mon 8/11/14		141			
1	-	Westwood E5	130 days	124on 2/13/14		142			
-	-	Strandwood E5	150 days	Man 8/25/14		143			
5	-	Surrise ES	30 days			43			
1		Shadelands Or.	(30 days	Mon \$/25/14		145			
3		Diable View MS	i35 days			145			
2		James Dent Adm.Ctr	135 days	Mon 9/22/14		47	411		
4	-	Loma Vista Cir.	135 days	Mon 9/22/14		14B			
5		Willow Creek Cpr	35 days	Mon 10/6/14		145	417		
-		Eagle Peak	130-days	Mon 10/13/14		50			
-		Gregory Gardens ES	130 days	Mon 10/13/14		51			
-		Delta View ES	30 days	(Man 10/20/14		52			
-		Closebut	20 days	111101120120174	C10 54/40/14	125			



Mt. Diablo Unified School District - District Wide Security Project

Subcontractor Scope of Work Narratives

Painting

The scope of work includes furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment to complete conduit, box and support hardware painting as required. The conduit painting is limited to exterior conduits, boxes, and hardware mounted to the underside of existing canopies as well as exposed conduits installed on exterior building walls. Conduits will typically be 1" diameter.

The work must occur during non-school hours (after 3:30 PM Monday thru Friday), weekends, or other weekdays when school is not in session.

The security project will be constructed with multiple phases, with approximately six sites per phase; painting does not need to occur concurrently at each site; the work may progress from one site to the next as long as the ongoing campus activities are not disturbed.

The exact footage of conduit cannot be identified at this time; however bids should be based on the following quantities:

12 sites - 700 lineal feet of 2" galvanized rigid steel conduit

41 sites- Provide 16 hours of misc. conduit painting and touch up; primarily exterior, possibly minor interior spot touch up. Taber will identify the locations to be painted.

All exterior conduit will be the same color for all sites; for any exterior touch up work the color will be selected from the District's standard exterior color schemes. There will not be any custom matching or special colors for select sites.



Mt. Diablo Unified School District - District Wide Security Project

Bid Package 3 - Electrical and Security Bid Package

Estimated Value: \$6,000,000 - \$8,000,000
Duration: 12 months
Liquidated Damages: \$5,000 Per Day/Per Site

The electrical and security bid package generally consists of providing labor, materials, and equipment to complete the installation of all raceway, electrical, and systems work to provide a fully functional security system in accordance with the bidding documents.

Subcontractors intending to submit proposals must furnish adequate evidence that clearly demonstrates its ability to complete a project of this size and complexity. The following documents must be submitted with your proposal (prospective subcontractors may submit the documents in advance of submitting a proposal; Taber will review the documents and issue a qualification determination within three days of a complete submission).

- 1. Provide evidence of current and active C-10 contractor's license.
- 2. Provide a letter from your current surety to include:
 - a. Confirmation that the subcontractor can provide 100% performance and payment bonds for the full amount of the subcontract. The surety must be admitted and authorized to issue bonds in the State of California. The surety must be "A" rated by A.M. Best.
 - b. Identify the subcontractor's bonding rates.
 - c. List any claims paid by the surety in the past five years for this subcontractor.
- Provide a copy of the subcontractors Experience Modification Ratio (EMR) for the past five years; the information shall be submitted on subcontractor's insurance broker's letterhead.
- 4. Provide a copy of subcontractors OSHA 300 log for the past three years.
- Provide a written statement regarding any claims your firm has filed against a general contractor or project owner during the past five years. Provide an explanation and disposition of any claims. Disputes less than \$25,000 need not be submitted.
- 6. Provide a copy of your OSHA citation log for the past five years directly from OSHA's website. Provide any written explanations as necessary.
- 7. Provide a written statement regarding any labor citations from the Department of Labor.
- 8. Provide a written statement regarding liquidated damages assessed against your firm for the past five years.
- 9. Provide three client references, including contact name, telephone number, and email address.



- 10. Provide information for three completed comparable projects, including project name, original contract value, final contract value, original completion date, final completion date, and description of the project/subcontractor's scope of work. Provide current contact information for the project owner's representative. Comparable projects must have been completed within the past seven years. Comparable projects must include multi-site projects with an aggressive delivery schedule, with a subcontract value in excess of \$5,000,000.
- 11. Provide a statement from your insurance broker confirming that subcontractor can provide the required insurance for the project.
- 12. Provide a brief narrative regarding subcontractor's ability to adequately staff the project, including concurrently staffing six sites; working day shift as well as swing shift.

Taber reserves the right to request additional information from subcontractors; Taber may utilize other resources in obtaining reference information or information regarding the subcontractor and its past performance. Prospective subcontractors will receive a pass/fail rating only.

Scope of Work

The subcontractor shall provide all labor, materials, and equipment to complete the installation of all raceways, electrical, and low voltage work required for a complete any fully functional system per the bid documents. At a minimum the subcontractor shall include:

- All supervision and coordination required for the work, including multiple supervisors as necessary when working multiple shifts. Each site shall have a designated full time qualified foreman; this individual(s) shall be present at all times when work is in progress.
- 2. Include pre-finishing of all interior conduits/raceways/fittings/boxes; touch-up as required after installation shall also be included in this scope.
- Install roof pads under blocks (roof pads will be furnished by others at one central location).
- Layout all saw cutting required on the project; saw cutting will be performed by others.
- Include all asphalt/concrete removal, trenching, backfill, bedding, compaction for new underground work. Spoils (asphalt/concrete/excess soil) shall be stockpiled for removal by others as directed by Taber.
- Include security guard services at all times when the existing system is nonoperational; if multiple sites are non-operational; each site must be provided with an individual guard.
- 7. Include Bosch security system, no substitutions are permitted.
- 8. Provide any necessary on site storage units (conex boxes) as required for subcontractors work.



- 9. In cases where existing conduit is re-used; repair or replace components, supports, straps, fittings, etc. to provide a first class installation.
- 10. In cases where new cable is installed thru existing raceways, subcontractor shall perform a preliminary check of the systems and document their condition in writing. After completion of the work subcontractor shall again inspect the systems and make any necessary repairs to restore to the pre-existing condition or better.
- 11. Include any labor necessary to move furniture and any other items within the buildings that interfere with the work, all furniture and items shall be returned to their pre-existing location at the end of the shift.
- 12. Include any labor, materials, and equipment necessary to thoroughly clean the work area at the end of each shift.
- Taber will provide custodial services as necessary to lock/unlock buildings.
- 14. Include all costs associated with Livescan verification of all employees.
- 15. Existing cabling within buildings circa 2005 may be re-used; presuming it is compatible with the new system and in good working order.
- 16. Motion sensors may be relocated within rooms as long as coverage is not affected, nor the devices impeded by curtains, etc.
- 17. At above ground locations, existing conduits containing fiber optic cabling can be used to install new security cable; presuming there is sufficient space and that the fiber is not damaged.
- 18.At below ground locations, new security cabling may be installed in existing conduit with existing LV systems; provided that there is no bleed-over and that subcontractor does not damage existing cables.
- 19. At above grade locations, new security cabling may pass thru existing boxes containing other LV cables, provided that existing systems are not damaged.
- Each elementary school shall have one siren, each middle and high school shall have two.
- 21. All sites, with the exception of M&O shall have a touchscreen keypad. Provide Alternate to provide standard keypads instead.
- 22. Pleasant Hill ES does not show an intrusion alarm panel; include a panel at this location.
- 23. Various admin locations do not show door contacts; all admin doors shall have contacts.
- 24. All work must be performed when school is not in session (typically swing shift and school breaks).



Proposal Format

- 1. There is no specific bid form for this project. Subcontractors shall provide lump sum pricing per site.
- 2. The bidding documents consist of the following:
 - a. Original Design Set prepared by Salas O'Brien
 - b. Project Manual
 - c. This document
 - d. Field investigation drawings
- 3. The field verification drawings are intended to provide actual field conditions and are intended to supplement the original design set. Subcontractors shall base their proposals on the notations from the field verification set. The intent of the verification drawings was to reduce the requirement for new pathways.
- 4. Do not price Alternate 1 or Alternate 2.
- 5. Provide a lump sum proposal for Alternate 3.
- 6. In addition to lump sum pricing per site the following must be provided:
 - a. Unit prices for Add/Deduct 2" underground conduit including trench and backfill.
 - b. Unit prices for Add/Deduct 2" underground conduit without trench and backfill.
 - c. Unit price for Add/Deduct 2" GRC canopy mounted raceway.
 - d. Unit price for Add/Deduct 1" GRC canopy mounted raceway.
 - e. Unit price for Add/Deduct ¾" EMT interior raceway.
 - f. Alternate to change from touch screen to keypads.
- 7. Provide an alternate to utilize a Bosch fully addressable system.
- 8. Provide an alternate to utilize 1" GRC instead of specified 2" at locations where 2" is not required based on Bosch design requirements.
- 9. Provide an alternate to remove all door contacts at Administration areas.

MDUSD Security System Replacement Subcontractor Solicitation Log

Bid Package 1 - Painting (Bids Due 10/17/13)

D & D Commercial Painting	No Bid	
Darden Painting	No Bid	
J & R Thompson Inc.	Proposed	
KBI Painting	Proposed	
Masker Painting	Proposed	
Mike Flynn Painting Old and New	Proposed	

Bid Package 2 - Asphalt Patching (Bids Due 10/17/13)

Antioch Paving	Proposed				
Barry's Backhoe	No Bid				
Bay Cities Paving and Grading	No Bid				
Jos J Albanese	No Bid				
MCK Construction	No Bid				
Pacific Coast General Engineering	Proposed				
R&M Paving	No Bid				
Taber Construction Inc.	Proposed				

Bid Package 3 - Electrical (Bids Due 10/24/13)

Contra Costa Electric	No Bid	
Cupertino Electric	No Bid	
Del Monte Electric	Proposed	
Design Electric	Declined	
McMillan Electric	No Bid	
Redwood City Electric	No Bid	
Rosendin Electric	No Bid	
Vanden Bos Electric	Declined	
W. Bradley Electric	No Bid	